
AGENDA 
Freedom Township Board of Supervisors 

January 3, 2022 
7:00 P.M. 

1. Call to Order 
 

2. Public Comment 
 
3. Approval of Minutes 

A. Public Hearing – December 14, 2022  
B. Regular Meeting – December 14, 2022 

 
4. Monthly Expenses 

A. Approval of the bills in the amount of $12,053.56 from the General Fund and $550.52 from 
the Escrow Fund for consideration. 
 

5. Manager & Road Reports 
 

6. EMS, Fire, & Police Reports 
 
7. Old Business 

A. Conditional use application, 175 Wenschhof Road – Cottage Industry, decision.  
 

B. Garage addition cost proposal discussion. 
 
C. Approval of an advertisement to hold a workshop on January 11, 2022 at 6:00 PM to 

discuss the garage addition project proposal (if needed).    
 
D. Award the 2023 stone contract to Specialty Granules, LLC. for consideration.  

Item Specialty Granules 

- FOB / Ton Delivered / Ton 

2A Aggregate $6.00 $11.25 

2RC Aggregate $6.00 $11.25 

#3 Stone $12.00 $17.25 

#4 Stone No Bid No Bid 

#8 Stone $16.00 $21.25 

#57 Stone $13.00 $18.25 

#67 Stone No Bid No Bid 

Cold Mix No Bid No Bid 

Screenings $9.00 $14.25 

Gabion Stone $13.00 $18.25 

AS3 Anti-Skid $16.00 $21.25 

 
8. New Business 
9. Other Business  
10. Public Comment 
11. Adjournment  


